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There is so much detail to be captured in a face. Cicero (106-43 BC) said: "The face is a picture of the mind
as the eyes are its interpreter." To capture a person's personality, there are many things to keep in mind, and
the authors of FACES show us how to match up a personality with lighting, posing, and composition.
Portraiture is truly an art, and this book dives deep into the details so that you end up with a gorgeous portrait
that both you and your subject love.

Not only is this book the most comprehensive title available on portraiture, but it contains stunning images.
Each image is paired with a lighting diagram, a description of why the type of image was chosen, and then
takes you through postproduction to put the finishing touches on. The authors also showcase a gallery of
portraits by renowned photographers.
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From reader reviews:

Connie Griffin:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed FACES:
Photography and the Art of Portraiture? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You realize beside you
can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or
you have other opinion?

William Perrotta:

The experience that you get from FACES: Photography and the Art of Portraiture could be the more deep
you digging the information that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to understand but FACES: Photography and the Art of Portraiture giving you thrill
feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through
anyone who read this because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes
your personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We advise you for having this particular FACES: Photography and the Art of
Portraiture instantly.

Florence Taylor:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the guide untitled FACES: Photography and the Art of Portraiture can be great
book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Loretta Jones:

You can spend your free time to see this book this book. This FACES: Photography and the Art of
Portraiture is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If
you did not have much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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