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One of the most influential institutions of higher learning in the world, the University of Chicago has a
powerful and distinct identity, and its name is synonymous with intellectual rigor. With nearly 170,000
alumni living and working in more than 150 countries, its impact is far-reaching and long-lasting.

With The University of Chicago: A History, John W. Boyer, Dean of the College since 1992, presents a
deeply researched and comprehensive history of the university. Boyer has mined the archives, exploring the
school’s complex and sometimes controversial past to set myth and hearsay apart from fact. The result is a
fascinating narrative of a legendary academic community, one that brings to light the nature of its academic
culture and curricula, the experience of its students, its engagement with Chicago’s civic community, and the
conditions that have enabled the university to survive and sustain itself through decades of change.

Boyer’s extensive research shows that the University of Chicago’s identity is profoundly interwoven with its
history, and that history is unique in the annals of American higher education. After a little-known false start
in the mid-nineteenth century, it achieved remarkable early successes, yet in the 1950s it faced a collapse of
undergraduate enrollment, which proved fiscally debilitating for decades. Throughout, the university retained
its fierce commitment to a distinctive, intense academic culture marked by intellectual merit and free debate,
allowing it to rise to international acclaim. Today it maintains a strong obligation to serve the larger
community through its connections to alumni, to the city of Chicago, and increasingly to its global
community.

Published to coincide with the 125th anniversary of the university, this must-have reference will appeal to
alumni and anyone interested in the history of higher education of the United States.
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From reader reviews:

Kim Bartlett:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The University of Chicago: A History as the daily
resource information.

Blake Nixon:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story or even their
experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write about advantage about
something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or daughters,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One of them is this
The University of Chicago: A History.

Barbara Gunter:

The publication with title The University of Chicago: A History includes a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

George Hyler:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This The University of Chicago: A History can be the
respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the
others?
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