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Are you struggling with students who have ADHD (Attention-Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder)?

There is likely to be at least one student in any mainstream class with ADHD, an evolving concept that
affects pupils' learning, concentration, behaviour and social relationships. In order to offer effective support
and maximize the learning potential of all students in your classroom you will need to understand the
different needs of all children, but perhaps especially those with ADHD.

With sections covering the background to ADHD, the school setting and the wider context of home life, this
complete resource ensures excellent practice for working with students with ADHD. It provides:

- examples of successful tried-and-tested strategies

- activities to use with children

- checklists

- information on referral pathways

- advice on working with parents

- case studies to facilitate discussion



A substantial bank of electronic resource materials is available from the SAGE website to use with the book,
including PowerPoint presentations and a range of photocopiable sheets. Packed with the most up-to-date
information and rooted in real-life examples from the author's own experiences and research, this is the
complete resource you need to help you work successfully with students who have ADHD.

Every class teacher, SENCO and teaching assistant in a primary or secondary school will find this an
invaluable and supportive guide.

Linda Wheeler is an independent education consultant and researcher, having been for many years a teacher
in both mainstream and special schools. She is currently a part-time Lecturer at the University of Worcester.
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Stewart:

The feeling that you get from The ADHD Toolkit is the more deep you rooting the information that hide into
the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but
The ADHD Toolkit giving you joy feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in particular way
that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known
enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to
understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for
having this specific The ADHD Toolkit instantly.

Ann Bland:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the data
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their ability in writing,
they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this The ADHD Toolkit.

Edmond Pounds:

The guide with title The ADHD Toolkit includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot
of help after read this book. This specific book exist new expertise the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of
the world. This specific book will bring you inside new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book
in your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Eric Sanders:

You can spend your free time to study this book this guide. This The ADHD Toolkit is simple to deliver you
can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring
the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the
particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this
book.
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