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How is a single dad supposed to navigate a new girlfriend into and out of his California king bed without his
son or daughter noticing? For Trey Ellis, raising children while trying to find his way through the unfamiliar
nuances of the contemporary dating scene as a single father has been a a sometimes nerve-racking challenge.

A Don Juan with a heart of gold, Ellis tracks both his sexy life as a swinging single father—his dates have
included a model, a French actress, and even an Italian contessa—and his nurturing and loving relationship
with his two young children. The result is Bedtime Stories, a charmingly poignant and hilarious story that
shows what happens when the glamorous life of an LA singleton collides with the life of a less than
glamorous dad who eats frozen dinners and changes dirty diapers.
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From reader reviews:

Jason Silva:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have free time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do this. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it
is suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need this kind of Bedtime Stories: Adventures
in the Land of Single-Fatherhood to read.

Maria Kim:

Bedtime Stories: Adventures in the Land of Single-Fatherhood can be one of your basic books that are good
idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that may increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Bedtime Stories:
Adventures in the Land of Single-Fatherhood but doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the
hottest and based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can certainly
drawn you into brand new stage of crucial considering.

Melinda Brown:

This Bedtime Stories: Adventures in the Land of Single-Fatherhood is brand-new way for you who has
intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper
you into it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this
Bedtime Stories: Adventures in the Land of Single-Fatherhood can be the light food to suit your needs
because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These books build itself in the
form which can be reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in
reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So ,
don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book style for your better life along with knowledge.

Ryan Harrison:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
looking for the Bedtime Stories: Adventures in the Land of Single-Fatherhood when you necessary it?
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