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In the years of expanding state authority following the Black Death, English common law permitted the
leasing of parishes by their rectors and vicars, who then pursued interests elsewhere and left the parish in the
control of lay lessees. But a series of statutes enacted by Henry VIII between 1529 and 1540 effectively
reduced such clerical absenteeism. Robert Palmer examines this transformation of the English parish and
argues that it was an important part of the English Reformation.

Palmer analyzes an extensive set of data drawn from common law records to reveal a vigorous and effective
effort by the laity to enforce the new statutes. Motivated by both economic and traditional ideals, the litigants
made the commercial activities of leaseholding and buying for resale and profit the exclusive domain of the
laity and acquired the power to regulate the clergy. According to Palmer, these parish-level reformations
presaged and complemented other initiatives of the crown that have long been considered central to the reign
of Henry VIII.
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From reader reviews:

John Richardson:

The book Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in
Legal History) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law,
Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in Legal History)? Several of you have a different opinion
about guide. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try
to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you
may share all of these. Book Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-
1550 (Studies in Legal History) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive function for
you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Elias Rosser:

Here thing why that Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550
(Studies in Legal History) are different and dependable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is
good nevertheless it depends in the content from it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Selling
the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in Legal History)
giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no guide that
similar with Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in
Legal History). It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the
thing this happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can easily bring
everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your technique home by train. In case you are having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law,
Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in Legal History) in e-book can be your choice.

Aaron Ryan:

The book Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in
Legal History) will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to
explain the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book
Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in Legal
History) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so
you can more easily to read the book.

James Snider:

The reserve untitled Selling the Church: The English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550
(Studies in Legal History) is the guide that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the
guide content that will be shown to you actually. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are



easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of study when write the book, therefore the information
that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Selling the Church: The
English Parish in Law, Commerce, and Religion, 1350-1550 (Studies in Legal History) from the publisher to
make you far more enjoy free time.
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