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Marriage and social inequality are closely interrelated. Marriage is dependent on the structure of marriage
markets, and marriage patterns have consequences for social inequality. This book demonstrates that in most
modern societies the educa tional system has become an increasingly important marriage market, particularly
for those who are highly qualified. Educational expansion in general and the rising educational participation
of women in particular unintentionally have increased the rate of "assortative meeting" and assortative
mating across birth cohorts. Rising educational homogamy means that social inequality is further enhanced
through marriage because better (and worse) educated single men and women pool their economic and
sociocultural advantages (and disadvantages) within couples. In this book we study the changing role of the
educational system as a marriage market in modern societies from a cross-national comparative perspective.
Using life-history data from a broad range of industrialized countries and longitudinal statistical models, we
analyze the process of spouse selection in the life courses of single men and women, step by step. The
countries included in this book vary widely in important characteristics such as demographic behavior and
institutional characteristics. The life course approach explicitly recognizes the dynamic nature of partner
decisions, the importance of educational roles and institutional circum stances as young men and women
move through their life paths, and the cumulation of advantages and disadvantages experienced by
individuals.
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From reader reviews:

Erin Chretien:

This book untitled Who Marries Whom?: Educational Systems as Marriage Markets in Modern Societies
(European Studies of Population) to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the
book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to
you to past this book from your list.

Lonnie Fazio:

The particular book Who Marries Whom?: Educational Systems as Marriage Markets in Modern Societies
(European Studies of Population) has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a
lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research
previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point easily after looking
over this book.

Joseph Yancey:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled Who
Marries Whom?: Educational Systems as Marriage Markets in Modern Societies (European Studies of
Population) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that
maybe unidentified for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a
guide then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The
Who Marries Whom?: Educational Systems as Marriage Markets in Modern Societies (European Studies of
Population) giving you one more experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful
info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern at this point is
your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning an activity. Do
you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Suk Barry:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the
book that recommended to you personally is Who Marries Whom?: Educational Systems as Marriage
Markets in Modern Societies (European Studies of Population) this book consist a lot of the information of
the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up.
The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some



investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.
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