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In the tradition of Robert Heinlein and Ray Bradbury, million-copy bestselling Halo author and game
developer Eric Nylund brings action-packed science fiction to a young audience with this riveting children's
debut. Twelve-year-old Ethan Blackwood has always known exactly what he wanted—to win the state
soccer championship, get into the best high school, and become an astronaut. Then he meets Madison and
Felix, who tell him something . . . insane. They claim that 50 years ago, aliens took over the earth, and
everyone past puberty is under their mind control. Ethan doesn't believe it. But then he sees for himself the
aliens' monster bug robots and the incredible way that Madison and Felix have learned to fight them. So
Ethan Blackwood has a choice: he can go back to his normal, suburban, protected lie of a life—or he can
become a Resister. This is science fiction on the lines of Scott Westerfield and Cory Doctorow for middle
graders.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Driver:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the e-book entitled The Resisters #1: The Resisters. Try to the actual book The
Resisters #1: The Resisters as your pal. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone
and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The
book makes you far more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we should make
new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Sandra Bland:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book
called The Resisters #1: The Resisters? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside you can
spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its opinion
or you have different opinion?

Thomas Moss:

The guide untitled The Resisters #1: The Resisters is the reserve that recommended to you to read. You can
see the quality of the book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book,
therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-
book of The Resisters #1: The Resisters from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Paul Herbert:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Resisters #1: The Resisters your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that
maybe unidentified for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a e-
book then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The
The Resisters #1: The Resisters giving you an additional experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern here is
your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to
try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?
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