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Heavy rain means trouble for Katie Ellen. With her parents away, she's left to take care of the mountaintop
farm alone until Josiah Huckabee happens to check on her. She used to think him charming--used to--but
before she can run Josiah off, a stranger appears. The bridge has washed out, stranding a weathered and
threatening man with them. Immediately sensing danger, Josiah steps in and claims the place--and Katie
Ellen--as his own. His farm, his wife, and this Silas Ruger character better be respectful. Furious, Katie Ellen
is forced to play along. Readers of Regina's Ozark Mountain Romance series will love seeing favorite
characters all grown up.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Stewart:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a go walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Her Dearly
Unintended (With This Ring? Collection): An Ozark Mountain Romance Novella? Maybe it is to become
best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you
can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some other opinion?

Bobby Bagwell:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be consider any time
those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then
you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take Her Dearly Unintended (With This Ring? Collection): An Ozark
Mountain Romance Novella as the daily resource information.

Jack Lau:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get lots of stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity have you got
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book you have read
is actually Her Dearly Unintended (With This Ring? Collection): An Ozark Mountain Romance Novella.

Deborah Hart:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got students? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know that
little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Her Dearly Unintended (With This Ring?
Collection): An Ozark Mountain Romance Novella.
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